Y A9UEZ www.govtpressmp.nic.in
Q «ft TRA e fFa s wF T

A% 187] N, erar, Feiw 22 3da 2016—3WMG 2, T 1938

fafy ok faurcht wrF fasm
i, femiw 22 o1 2016

. 6146-126-FFRE-31- (M. ) -1 —weny four ww o Frafafes sfufem fm w feils 21 g, 2016
1 T TG F SRR WK 8 G L, TaggNl HEHRT S SR % o v feRar S .

TEAYRY % ToUUel % AW ¥ 91 FRAGER,
[T qrad, sifafiiaa wfue.

Heayeyr StfutE
SRR L& T 03§ 7
Wﬁmwmwmwﬁmuﬁr&xé«mw
fafir (doirem) stfufem, 098

feror-gt.

. wfm 9m.

. HIT—U%

WYY THE |UT 27298y Ao SuTeae (9 wer war) tfufam, ejeR
(U 9 T LRYR ) T HINEL.
R. I R Rl TYIYH.
3. URT 3 hI AU
TRT—aT
Wﬁmwﬁmuﬁm(éﬁww)a&rﬁm gR¢0
. (wHi ¢ T 2R¢0 ) T HIEA.
¥, 9N 3 1 GIMEA. :
W YR ¥ T HINEA.
' 373



374 v gy TeE, fedi 22 3li| 2016

Tegey AfutE
HH% L& U R0%E
WWWM@WW&T@WWWWW
fafir (dvirer) artafram, R0¢s

[ i 3¢ 0, 08 W TeUUTS i Al W gg; vt mm(w)"ﬁmwaﬂa :
0¢% W TAWER TR 6t 8. 1

Wﬁmwmmm(%w = ) arfufirem, QR9R Te HeAwRyT faur |
et wfiwer (A qur weT) AfufEE, e3¢0 @i it deifa W ¥ sifufem

I TR % wewad o § weaw faur-Hed s Frfafed w9 § we aifufafid € —

i - z.Wa!ﬁ:ﬁmwﬁrmmﬁnwmﬁm'@mmmaamwwaqﬁﬁmuﬁwémam
wr fafy (defee) rfafrm, 028 ©.

H—Th
TeAuReT FruT |uT LAY A U (AT qAT W) AfUFTEH, LR0R
(FUIH 0 T TR0 ) T WM,

SRT R T TG, 3 mmwmmm(%qmw)aﬂm 293 (HHIH 6 T

22\9?)(ﬁwﬁsﬁmwmﬁm%mﬁﬁ%@%)ﬁm?tmmmﬁm
T i W, AUl —

assmer @Al N m@ﬁmﬁvmv@mmaﬁmmmmw
) ~
ST 3 BT T 3. T P F AR 3 % WM W, Praffen o i s s, st —
aréwara% ar “3, (z)maﬁmmmmmwwmﬁm'
JATHY <hl Tkl
ﬁ,“m () areae & YaATel SO S0 whare Frafer-a oer qur Sureae ®
Hefre Tor vud wiaara Fate-aa s fear s
(3) oreae Qe SWEAy I UH T Ui o vl ufafe & fewrs @ FeR
s fean smom. .
WIT—a
TeayyT Faam | Aar aiaue (S ar wwr) atufrm, g¢o
(wmieh ¢ W 240 ) T HIlE.
ST 3 T U, ¥, TeAwRy fAum W a1 e (3 A 5w AfuEE, 2’¢o (FHAE ¢ T ’¢o) (S TEH

To% TvETd uo situtEm % W 4 e ) U 3 N, S e e % WH W, v A
TR TefyE fow ST,



ey TeTe, fais 22 31 2016 , 374 (1)

. Wet fufEm & awr ¥ W, — ' HITRT ¢ ST HINE.
(T) Soumr (g) ¥, v e TR % WA W, v ' Hareha o’ wenfia
fer md;
() IR () F, Wew e @R F W W, vy e g v
ferg wITd;

(1) SUuTT (3 ), I O TSI AT E 3 T O, 9SS Uk S uie 6 Rt
ferw .

9T, fai 22 el 2016

. 6146-126-THETT-3-(T.) -3, — "G ¥ TAuW F ST 48 F WS (3) F AW T, WA
oUW STeaE Qo SUEAe T Yar gRve aa aen s fafy (Heie) sifufwm, 2016 (RHIE 16 W 2016) H
ST STER T % WIRER ¥ THGER WHIvE foRar S @

WYY % TSI A Y qT SACUIER,
YT ATed, Stfafta |

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 16 oF 2016

THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA ADHYAKSHA TATHA UPADHYAKSHA EVAM
NETA PRATIPAKSHA VETAN TATHA BHATTA VIDHI (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2016.

TABLE OF CONTENTS
Sections :

1. Short title.
- PART 1

AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA ADHYAKSHA TATHA
UPADHYAKSHA (VETAN TATHA BHATTA) ADHINIYAM, 1972 (NO 27 OF 1972)

2. Substitution of Section 2

3. Substitution of Section 3.

PART 1T

" AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA NETA PRATIPAKSHA
(VETAN TATHA BHATTA) ADHINIYAM, 1980 (NO. 8 OF 1980)

4, Amendment of Section 3.

5. Amendment of Section 4.



374 (2)

Ty o, fEiw 22 el 2016

Short title.

Substitution of
Section 2.

Salary of Speaker
and  Deputy
Speaker.

Substitution of
Section 3.

~
Sumptuary
allowance,
constituency

allowance and?

daily allowance
to Speaker and
Deputy Speaker.

Amendment of
Section 3.

Amendment of
Section 4.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 16 or 2016

THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA ADHYAKSHA TATHA UPADHYAKSHA
EVAM NETA PRATIPAKSHA VETAN TATHA BHATTA VIDHI (SANSHODHAN)

ADHINIYAM, 2016.

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 21st April, 2016; assent first published in the‘Madhya Pradesh Gazette

. (Extra-ordinary)”, dated the 22nd April, 2016].

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Adhyéksha Tatha Upadhyaksha
(Vetan Tatha Bhatta) Adhiniyam, 1972 and the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Neta
Pratipaksha (Vetan Tatha Bhatta) Adhiniyam, 1980.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Leglslature in the sixty-seventh year of the Repubhc of
India as follows:—

1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Adhyaksha Tatha Upadhyaksha
Evam Neta Pratipaksha Vetan Tatha Bhatta Vidhi (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2016.

" PART 1

AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA ADHYAKSHA TATHA
UPADHYAKSHA (VETAN TATHA BHATTA) ADHINIYAM, 1972 (NO. 27 OF 1972)

2. For Section 2 of the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Adhyaksha Tatha Upadhyaksha (Vetan
Tatha Bhatta) Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 27 of 1972) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), the
following Section shall be substituted, namely:—

. “2.

There shall be paid a salary per mensem of rupees forty seven thousand to the
Speaker and rupees forty five thousand to the Deputy Speaker.”.

3. For Section 3 of the principal Act, the following Section shall be substituted, namely:—

“3‘

)

3

~
(1) There shall be paid to the Speaker a sumptuary allowance of forty eight
thousand rupees per mensem and to the Deputy Speaker a sumptuary allowance
of forty five thousand rupees per mensem. '

There shall be paid to the Speaker a constituency allowance of -forty five thousand
rupees per mensem and to the Deputy Speakef‘a constituency allowance of thirty
five thousand rupees per mensem.

There shall be paid to the Speaker and the Deputy Speaker a da11y allowance of
one thousand five hundred rupees per day.”.

PART T

AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA NETA PRATIPAKSHA

(VETAN TATHA BHATTA) ADHINIYAM, 1980 (NO. 8 OF 1980)

4. In Section 3 of the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Neta Pratlpaksha (Vetan Tatha Bhatta)
Adhiniyam, 1980 (No. 8 of 1980) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), for the words
“twenty seven thousand”, the words “forty five thousand” shall be substituted.

5. In Section 4 of the principal Act,—

@

in sub-section (1), for the words “thirty thousand”, the words, “forty five
thousand” shall be substituted;



TEAYRY TS, i 22 o1dw 2016 374 (3)

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “twenty seven thousand”, the words “thirty five
thousand” shall be substituted;

(iii) in sub-section (3), for the words “one thousand two hundred”, the words “one
thousand five hundred” shall be substituted.

a5

T, wreERTa gmlamé@:fm, HEAYRY GHT WSHIT Fara qRUTerR, W ¥ gfia aen weifia—2016.



