39 J99ES www.govtpressmp.nic.in
¥ ff T e fran s we R,

HHE 194] fraret, YeRaR, fiw 20 atder 2016—3WrE 9, Tk 1938

ﬁfaaﬂtﬁmﬁaﬂﬁﬁm

Are, fiw 29 o8 2016

. 6668—134-FFHIT-31- (. ) -3 —HemRy faur v o1 Frefafaa sifufem fm w e 27 eia 2016
FT TSI TG H STAR W B 99T ¢, TACER SHUHRy F SHht % fed e fe s €
. ~

HEAYRSl & TSI % W 9 a0 ARIMTR,
YT ared, fals wfmE.

387



388 Heayey TeTas, fadien 29 31t 2016

qeAyeYT

U Ro T R0%E
TETTRYT R Tt (dehe ) sfufm, R0%%§

[feiw R0 o, 088 Y WU W AN WE gE, AR Aoy Twww (ImnEwer)” ¥ s
3R 3e, 202§ Y WO AR YR @ T ]

WAYRYT TRUTees tm aifufem, zwawww;r&wwmaﬁrﬁm 2%§¢ @ 3
ol e g .

A TR ¥ TSHSd o # HeAuew faum-Hed gr frefafad 9 H 9w sifufrita € -
ifara . 3. 34 srfufem = dfew T weavey TRuifae fafy (deeE) sifufrm, 028 R
HIT-Th

HEAYSSr R R fifrm, Q]us (FHiT 3 T LRUE ) Tl HeieH

weTmRw Hfufem . WY TRAfad B afutrEm, 2us (I 3 W 2R4E) W, UN 233-F H,
w® R} W SUHN (R) H—
L QuE THT WIITErT.

() o “'uw iR’ % T W, e Q) wiiwa”! wif R S,
@) fefafaa sy Ser S, o7l —

i P T 39 YR WG BN STell Yok St i T SR STErEa TR by
TR S Grafaa w3 # steyen ¥ afEsTIe & fraragd & fau deifya
mmmmawwwammmmmmﬁ
fara ST, ",

&

qAT-
HEAYRPT TATART ARICTA, 28 (FHHIE 30 T Q&R ) Hyirer

3. HEAYRY TRUIETR Sffrm, L]&Q (FHi® 30 T 2382) W, WN &} H, SUuW (R) ¥
eayRyr Hfufam
sy 4§ —

FUTH 39 WA
95 T Y. )
() = ‘‘u& gfvm”’ & WF |, I ' gfoea’’ wfia feg s,

(@)  Hed F WA ) g frm wenfia fR s e aevE frefataa susy siel
GITQ,E‘H?IT?[:—

“ rRTfereRT It 3 TR TRYE i TH YHR I T Sl Yeeh Y R 1 ST STHrE
o # uREERl ® frafad w0 3 e T ufdemedl % R &
foru weiferg TRfere aieg a1 R IR N 1ear Susht o § fag e R
w1 gfaserE w0 | forar s



TeAyRy U9, fadien 29 31die 2016

388 (1)

e, femie 29 e@a 2016

F. 6668-134-SFRU-31-(WL.) -3 —uRa F WEAE % ST 348 F @UE (3) F W H, WEAUH
TROfeE oy (deied) efufEm, 2016 (FHIF 20 W 2016) HI ST TER TN ¥ WHHR W TG

e foFen S g,

TR ¥ TSI % AH | 91 STRATER,
T A1EE, Afafam wfw.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 20 or 2016

THE MADHYA PRADESH NAGARPALIK VIDHI (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2016.

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 27 April, 2016; assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette
(Extra-ordinary)”, dated the 29 April, 2016].

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 and the
‘Mahdya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the sixty-seventh year of the Republic of

India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Nagarpalik Vidhi (Sanshodhan)
Adhiniyam, 2016.
PART-1

AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION
ACT, 1956 (No. 23 OF 1956)

2. In the Madhya Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 (No. 23 of 1956), in Section
133-A in sub-section (1),—

(i) for the words "one per centum”, the words "two per centum" shall be substituted;

(ii) the following provision shall be added, namely :—

"~ ~ "The amount of duty so received td the Municipal Corporatlﬁn shall be used for

implementation of infrastructure development projects or for repayment of
loans taken for implementation of such projects by or on behalf of the
concerned Municipal Corporation.".

PART-II
AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH MUNICIPALITIES
ACT, 1961 (No. 37 OF 1961)
3. In the Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961 (No. 37 of 1961), in Section 161, in the
opening paragraph of sub-section (1),—
(i) for the words "one per centum", the words "two per centum" shall be substituted;

(ii) for colon, the full stop shall be substituted and thereafter the following provision shall
be added, namely :(— ;

"The amount of duty so received to the Municipal Council or Nagar Parishad shall be used
for implementation of infrastructure development projects or for repayment of loans
taken for implementation of such projects by or on behalf of the concerned Municipal
Council or Nagar Parishad;".

Short title.

Amendment to
the Madhya
Pradesh Act. No.
23 of 1956.

Amendmenttothe
Madhya Pradesh
Act No.37 of 1961.

foreioes, TR TROT 4o SE W, WY GRY VHE FEE HRoer, We § gfid aon whih—2016.



